
Event 
The showcase will be held at Tattooed Moms, a graffiti and rock 
influenced bar located at 530 South Street, Philadelphia PA 
(19147) on Friday, September 6th. The art show will be taking over the 
first lounge area on the second floor. This is a 21 and over event 
so please be sure to bring ID the night of. ID must be valid! 
 
Our goal is to have a fun challenge for everyone artistically and 
take everyone out of their comfort zone while celebrating a 
different theme each show. 
 
Due to the location, we encourage that the majority of pieces can 
be hung from the wall or fit into a portfolio to be displayed. Three- 
dimensional pieces may be included but will require pre- approval 
by the JERKS crew. The show is a one night only event therefore, 
all work must be hung early the day of the show and must be 
taken down that night. 
 
All work in this show ​MUST​ relate to a cult movie or TV show. Some examples: 
-Mystery Science Theater 3000 
-The Room 
-Troll 2 
-TROMA 
-Twin Peaks 
 
Artist Responsibility and Show Outline 
 
Artists may submit as many pieces as they would like and pay just 
$5 per piece submitted. We are happy to work together to create 
the best use of space for you so please reach out if your work is 
small or very large. The participation fees must be paid prior to 
the event by August 30th. 
 
The participation fees goes directly to the production of future 
films as well as covers the cost for the art shows. The fee also 
allows showing artists the opportunity to keep whatever profit is 
made from selling their work at the event. 
 
Participating artists are in charge of any matting and framing 
required for their pieces. Inclusion of business cards or 
promotional items are recommended but not required. 
 



Each artist is responsible for hanging and preparing their space 
for the event the day of. The upstairs will be available from 2 PM 
to 5 PM. The event begins at 6pm so we must enforce that all 
work is hung no later than 530pm. If you would like to come 
earlier that day, please contact us to set everything up. No artist is 
permitted to set up after 6pm and will be turned away due to late 
arrival and payment will not be returned or transferred. 
 
Jerks will supply some basic hanging supplies but it is highly 
suggested to bring your own supplies and materials. It is highly 
recommended to bring additional lighting and an extension cord 
for your space. Due to the large amount of graffiti and art already 
covering the walls of the upstairs, we suggest purchasing a sheet 
of poster board or fabric to place behind each of your pieces to 
separate it in space. You are welcome to use any color you wish 
for backing color. The backing is also a suggestion, please feel 
free to decorate your space as you wish. 
 
We are happy to make any name tags and pricing for any artist 
that requests it but require all information must be sent no later 
then a week before the show. 
 
SHOWING ARTISTS AND THOSE IN ATTENDANCE MUST BE 
AT LEAST 21 WITH VALID ID. NO ARTIST WILL BE 
REFUNDED OR TRANSFERRED PAYMENT FOR LACK OF 
VALID ID. 
 
Regardless of the event going on, please keep in mind that 
this is a bar and we must go by the rules of the bar and 
Owner. 
 
Please be considerate when taking down your displays- that 
means removing all nails, screws, signage and cloth used for your 
display. We are happy to offer supplies for you to use but we 
should not have to clean up after you. We will be enforcing a 
"clean up" fee if we need to take anything down from your space 
after you have left. The price will be determined based on what 
 
you leave behind for us to do and you will not be welcomed to 
return to a show until paying the fee is paid. 



If you have already paid for a future show at the time of your 
clean up fee being issued you can have us take the fee out of 
what you've paid or we can hold your payment until the fee is 
paid. We work hard to keep prices low, go above and beyond for 
whatever you need and would appreciate the same respect given 
in return in the form of being considerate of your space, the bar, 
our staff and fellow artists. 
 
If you pay for a space and do not show up at the show with no 
email, text or call that you will not be able to make it you will not 
be welcomed to return to a show and your payment will not be 
refunded. It only takes a moment to let us know that you can't 
make it and regardless of your reason, we are as understanding 
as possible but is not fair to take away a space from an artist that 
would actually show up. 
 
Any artist that drops from the show more than a week before can 
request a refund or have their payment transferred for a future 
showcase. Any cancellation within a week may only have their 
payment transferred for a future show with no refund. 
 
About JERKS Productions 
 
JERKS Productions is a Philadelphia based production team 
working in the underground scene specializing in horror and art 
house style films. 
If you are interested in participating in this event, please contact 
us through JERKSProductions@gmail.com, Facebook.com/ 
JERKSProductions or contact our Showcase Director, Jill Trager 
through Facebook or the Jerks email. 
 
Payment 
 
Payment can be made through our paypal link: paypal.me/ 
JERKSProductions 
 
To pay in cash or check, please email us and we will move 
forward from there. 
 
YOUR PAYMENT WILL BE SEEN AS AN AGREEMENT TO THE 
ABOVE TERMS AND CONDITIONS. IF YOU HAVE ANY 
QUESTIONS OR CONCERNS PLEASE CONTACT US RIGHT AWAY. 


